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State of Oklahoma
Office of Management and Enterprise Services
Capital Assets Management
Construction and Properties Department

BID TABULATION SHEET

Project Name: Bldg 132 Renovation CAP Project Number: {18031
Project Location: Camp Gruber/Braggs, OK Bid Date:[9/5/2017
Using Agency: Oklahoma Military Department Project Manager: |KEITH JONES

Bidder's Name: VOY CONSTRUCTION WILLIAMS CONTRACTING DIVERSIFIED CONSTRUCTION
City, State: TULSA, OK MUSKOGEE, OK EDMOND, OK
Notes:
ADDENDA DAYS| 150 ADDENDA| 1 DAYS| 150 ADDENDA| 1 DAYS| 150
AFFIDAVITS X BONDS X AFFIDAVITS BONDS X AFFIDAVITS] X BONDS| X
TOTAL| BASEBID $672,810.00 BASE BID $688,000.00 BASE BID $765,000.00
ALTERNATES
Alternate 1 pepucT] | $16,377.00 aop| x | peouct| | $17,00000 | amo| x [ oeouct| | $25,000.00
UNIT PRICES
ITEM ary Unit Price QTy Unit Price Qry Unit Price
Lead Based Paint Remediation per SF $8.50| persF $15.00( persF NO BID
Asbestos floor Tile Remediation per SF $5.00| persF $4.00| persF NO BID
Asbestos Pipe Insulation Remediation per LF $45.00( perlF $60.00( perlLF NO BID
Asbestos Duct Insulation Remediation per LF $35.00| pertr $12.00( perLF NO BID
Mold Remediation per SF $9.00| persF $12.00| persF NO BID
Concrete in Place per SF $10.00| persF $8.00| persF $10.00
Asphalt in Place per SF $8.00| persF $10.00| persF $3.50




Bidder's Name: CEDAR RIDGE CONTRACTING HOEY CONSTRUCTION BUILDERS UNLIMITED
City, State: WOODWARD, OK TULSA, OK TULSA, OK
Notes:
ADDENDA 1 DAYS| 150 ADDENDA| 1 DAYS| 150 ADDENDA| 1 DAYS| 150
AFFIDAVITS X BONDS X AFFIDAVITS X BONDS X AFFIDAVITS] X BONDS| X
TOTAL| BASE BID $846,900.00 BASE BID $650,000.00 BASE BID $718,395.00
ALTERNATES
Alternate 1|  Abp| X | pepuCT] | $17,600.00 | aoo| X | peouct| [ $15,00000 | Abo| x | beouct| | $14,694.00
UNIT PRICES
ITEM ary Unit Price QTy Unit Price Qry Unit Price
Lead Based Paint Remediation per SF $16.50( persF $7.50| persk $13.44
Asbestos floor Tile Remediation per SF $3.10| persF $5.50| persF $3.36
Asbestos Pipe Insulation Remediation per LF $25.00( pertF $9.50| pertF $61.60
Asbestos Duct Insulation Remediation per LF $5.00| perltF $10.00( pertF $8.96
Mold Remediation per SF S0.70| persF $10.00| persF $13.44
Concrete in Place per SF $11.00| persF $7.50| persF $11.20
Asphalt in Place per SF $9.00| persF $5.50| persF $8.40




